

RESOLUTION 2026-05-26-04

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Oil Change Services to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded bidders are Express Oil Change and Tire Engineers and Gray's Tire and Service Center.

Bids from Stivers Ford of Birmingham and All Things Right of Way were considered non-responsive as with this bid, we were not seeking mobile services.

Said eBid #2026-4-11666 is located in the office of the county's Chief Financial Officer.

QUADRANT NORTH	Express Oil Change	Gray's Tire and Service Center
OEM Requirements for Synthetic Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
6 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	96.98	No bid
7 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	107.97	No bid
8 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	118.96	No bid
9 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	129.96	No bid
10 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	140.94	No bid
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	10.99	No bid
OEM Requirements for Conventional Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
5 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	60.98	No bid
6 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	67.97	No bid
7 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	74.96	No bid
8 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	81.96	No bid
9 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	88.94	No bid
10 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	95.93	No bid
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	6.99	No bid

QUADRANT SOUTH	Express Oil Change	Gray's Tire and Service Center
OEM Requirements for Synthetic Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
6 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	96.98	78.51
7 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	107.97	86.27
8 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	118.96	94.03
9 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	129.96	101.79
10 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	140.94	109.55
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	10.99	6.99
OEM Requirements for Conventional Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
5 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	60.98	70.76
6 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	67.97	78.51
7 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	74.96	86.27
8 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	81.96	94.03
9 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	88.94	101.79
10 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	95.93	109.55
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	6.99	6.99

Calera

QUADRANT EAST	Express Oil Change	Gray's Tire and Service Center
OEM Requirements for Synthetic Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
6 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	96.98	No bid
7 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	107.97	No bid
8 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	118.96	No bid
9 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	129.96	No bid
10 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	140.94	No bid
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	10.99	No bid

OEM Requirements for Conventional Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
5 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	60.98	No bid
6 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	67.97	No bid
7 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	74.96	No bid
8 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	81.96	No bid
9 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	88.94	No bid
10 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	95.93	No bid
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	6.99	No bid

QUADRANT WEST	Express Oil Change	Gray's Tire and Service Center
OEM Requirements for Synthetic Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
6 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	96.98	No bid
7 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	107.97	No bid
8 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	118.96	No bid
9 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	129.96	No bid
10 Quart Oil Change with Synthetic Engine Oil and Filter	140.94	No bid
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	10.99	No bid
OEM Requirements for Conventional Oil	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
5 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	60.98	No bid
6 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	67.97	No bid
7 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	74.96	No bid
8 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	81.96	No bid
9 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	88.94	No bid
10 Quart Oil Change with Conventional Oil and Filter	95.93	No bid
Price per Quart for each additional quart of oil above 10 Quarts.	6.99	No bid

